Jenifer Baker </O=NWTM/OU=EXCHANGE ADMINISTRATIVE GROUP

T (FYDIBOHF23SPDLT)/CN=RECIPIENTS/CN=JENIFER BAKER 1E2>
Sent: Monday, July 9, 2018 10:43 AM

To: Paul Wagner <paul wagner@nwtmint.com>

Subject: FW: Die Recovery Request Form

Paul — please see the email string below. This customer’s piece is import. He is looking for the China company’s
information.

How should | respond?

Thank you-
Jenifer

From: Tim [mailto:hotrodbiker@gmail.com]
Sent: Monday, July 09, 2018 10:37 AM

To: Jenifer Baker

Subject: Re: FW: Die Recovery Request Form

I'm looking for the company information for the company that has the actual dies, not someone here in the
states.

regards,
Tim Marquez

On Mon, Jul 9, 2018 at 10:57 AM, Jenifer Baker <Jenifer Baker(@medallic.com™> wrote:
Marty Colwell

Sierra Mint

775-298-8774

Marty.colwell@sierramint.com

From: Tim [mailto:hotrodbiker@amail.com]
Sent: Monday, July 09, 2018 8:43 AM

To: Jenifer Baker

Subject: Re: FW: Die Recovery Request Form

Thank you, that would be great.
Is it possible to get the contact information of that import vendor?
Regards,

Tim Marquez

On Mon, Jul 9, 2018, 10:08 AM Jenifer Baker <Jenifer Baker@medallic.com> wrote:
Hi Timothy,

Looking over your attached invoices the coin you order is produced from our import vendor. I do not have
access to those dies, however I can refer you to a company that can place a reorder using your existing dies.
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Marty Colwell

Sierra Mint

775-298-8774
Marty.colwell@sierramint.com

Thank you -
Jenifer Baker

From: webmaster@nwtmint.com [mailto:webmaster@nwtmint.com]
Sent: Wednesday, July 04, 2018 2:31 PM

To: Jenifer Baker

Subject: Die Recovery Request Form

The following info was submitted from: http://dierequest.nwtmint.com/

first-name: Timothy
last-name: Marquez

address1: 8925 Lanna Bluff Loop

city: Austin
state: TX
zip: 78749
country: US

email: hotrodbiker@gemail .com

phone: 512-753-9544
company: Big Dog Biker

company-address]1: bigdogbiker.com

die-count: 2

comment: I just happened to find out about the bankruptcy today, as I was looking to place a new order. I've
never seen any sort of bankruptcy notice prior to today.
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Jenifer Baker </O=NWTM/OU=EXCHANGE ADMINISTRATIVE GROUP

From: (FYDIBOHF23SPDLT)/CN=RECIPIENTS/CN=JENIFER BAKER 1E2>
Sent: Monday, July 9, 2018 8:22 AM

To: 'shepard.stone@yale.edu’

Subject: FW: Die Recovery Request Form

Attach: QT1037-A pdf

Hi Shepard,

Looking over your attached invoices the coin you order is produced from our import vendor. I do not have
access to those dies, however I can refer you to a company that can place a reorder using your existing dies.

Marty Colwell

Sierra Mint

775-298-8774
Marty.colwell@sierramint.com
Thank you -

Jenifer Baker

From: webmaster@nwtmint.com [mailto:webmaster@nwtmint.com]
Sent: Saturday, June 30, 2018 8:40 PM

To: Jenifer Baker

Subject: Die Recovery Request Form

The following info was submitted from: http://dierequest.nwtmint.com/
first-name: Shepard

last-name: Stone

address1: 712 Robert Frost Drive

city: Branford

state: CT

zip: 06405-5836

country: US

email: shepard.stone@yale.edu

phone: 203-481-7009

die-count: 2

comment: The order number for the coin was "QT1037 A108697-8 BG Shepard Stone"
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IMPORT S
100 QTY

Raised Silver Metal Raised Silver Metal
I Recessed Silver Metal I Recessed Silver Metal
+ Semi-Sandblast + Semi-Sandblast

3D B 187c
B 504c H 231c
I 357

B 504c

Actual Size
Size: 1.75"

Art Job Number: QT1037-A
Project: BG Shepard Stone
Designer: Andrew Wilson
Artist/lllustrator: Andrew Wilson
| Salesperson: Ernie Fulton

" Client: BG Shepard Stone
Date: 04/06/12

© Northwest Territorial Mint has a worldwide copyright on the artwork in this coin.
The artwork is not to be copied by anyone by any means without first receiving permission from Northwest Territorial Mint.
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